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e-Tempo 
“WHEN A KNIGHT ACTS SELFLESSLY,  

HE ACTS ON BEHALF OF THE WORLD”  

-YOU CAN BE THAT MAN- 

Brother Knights, 
 
Change is coming in 2021.  Expect the Covid to continue to affect 
our operation into the fall.  That being said, we as a council are 
still doing a lot of good work.  We helped set up Christmas lights 
and decorations inside and outside St Martin of Tours church.  
Thanks to all of our knights and especially our Knight of the 
Month, Mark Ruminsky for his time spent and his continued 
efforts to get meals to those families in need for Christmas.  In 
addition, Ken Kieck and Rich Doubek attended the March for Life 
in Madison. 
 
The Business Meeting format has changed. The change will be 
seen at the next meeting on Tuesday, January 12th in the Narthex 
at St Martin of Tours church at 7:30pm.  The meeting will also be 
available via Zoom.   You will be getting an in e-mail with the 
invite. Expect the meetings to be available online even after the 
Covid is gone as it has been found in other councils that more 
members attend meetings from home, especially those that were 
at work all day. 
 
We will also have an exemplification before the Business meeting 
on the 12th starting around 6:45. 
 
Please pray for those councils that have been hit hard by the Covid 
both in Knights and their mode of operations. 
 
Fraternally, 
Ken Keefer 
 
If anyone knows a brother knight who is ill, in distress, or has 
passed on, please contact the Grand Knight or the Financial 
Secretary. 
 
 

Grand Knight 

Ken Keefer 414.339.4999 
  
Chaplain 

Rev. Terry Langley, SCJ 
  
Financial Secretary 

Robert Konzal 262.244.7288 

Deputy Grand Knight 

Joe Collins 

Chancellor 

Ken Kieck 

Recorder 

Philip Voglewede 

Treasurer 

Gerry Ruedinger 

Advocate 

Gary Von Bargen 

Warden 

Bill Meier 

Trustees  

 Rick Briski 

 Dave Kunze  

 Ray Lenz 

Guards 

Dave Goehring 

Nick Ioder 
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Important Days to Remember: 
Exemplification – January 12th – 6:45pm, Narthexm St 

Martin of Tours 

Business Meeting – January 12th, 7:30pm, Narthex, St 

Martin of Tours and Virtual 

Officers Meeting – January 26th, Science Lab, St 

Martin of Tours and Virtual 

 

Members in Need of Prayers:  

Henry Lisiecki 

Dennis Amaturo 

Nick Ioder 

Rudy Mishich 

Rich Briski 

  

Brother Knights Celebrating 

Birthdays in January 

  

Ermin H Humpal 

Daniel W Knippel 

Jose Angel Romero 

John F Castro 

Gary M Von Bargen 

Thomas F Kuehn 

Russell J Sepanski 

Nick E Ioder 

Frederick J Melk 

Robert C Sitalski 

Timothy E Shiroda 

James A Rivera 

 

Changes to Business Meeting 

1. Opening prayer - Our Father 

2. No Warden’s Report 

3. The previous meeting minutes are no longer 

read. 

4. Reports limited to 3 minutes 

a. Results if reporting completion of a 

project. 

b. Status if giving an update on a 

project. 

c. Clear requests for needed support. 

d. Recommendations for further 

actions. 

5. Old Business - for any unfinished motions. 

6. New Business – for new motions as brought 

forward from officer’s meeting. 

7. Good of the Order is for awards and 

presentations 

8. Closing prayer and intentions (intentions 

should be given in writing before the 

meeting)  Blessed Michael McGivney 

Canonization Prayer 

Record Your Volunteer Hours Now!  

Go to trinitycouncil4580.com 

1. On the left buttons click “Members Only” 

2. Type in Member # and password 

3. Goto “Record Your Volunteer Hours and 

Visits” 

4. Change YTD Totals to 2020 

5. Enter the date of volunteering and hours 

or just enter 12/31/2020 and enter all 

hours 

6. Click “Submit all Entries” 

7. Click “Confirm all Entries” 

8. Enter another date and hours if needed. 

9. Data is automatically posted. 

 


